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In Spain, 82% of the provinces have an intervention plan 
to promote continuity of care for suicidal patients, but what 
is reported by the 2020 Clinical Practice Guide for the Pre-
vention and Treatment of Suicidal Behavior in relation to 
management is scarce. of the suicidal patient in a hospital 
environment1. Previous suicidal behavior is the risk factor 
most closely related to recidivism2 and hospital admission for 
attempted suicide has been associated with a severity profile 
characterized by greater recidivism and greater lethality of 
attempts3 making it essential to deploy a plan prevention in 
this regard.

The incidence of suicide in the hospital is high, higher 
than that observed in the general population. It is 250 per 
100,000 psychiatric hospital admissions and 1.8 per 100,000 
general hospital admissions, which is four to five times higher 
than in the general population. From 5 to 6.5% of suicides 
are committed in hospital: 3 to 5.5% occur in psychiatric 
hospitals and about 2% in general hospitals. As risk factors 
for suicide in the psychiatric unit, the accessibility to one or 
more means of suicide and the hospitalization period stand 
out, being higher during the first week of hospitalization and 
within 2 weeks after hospital discharge. Aspects related to 
the organization have also been described: inadequate su-
pervision, underestimation of the risk of suicide by the teams, 
poor communication within the teams, and the lack of an 
intensive care unit promote the risk of suicide. Other predis-
posing factors are the existence of a personal history of sui-
cide (but also a family history) and a suicide attempt shortly 
before admission, a diagnosis of schizophrenia or a mood 
disorder, being hospitalized without consent, living alone, 
and hospital escapes. In general hospitals, the chronicity and 
severity of the somatic illness, the patient’s personality, and 
the existence of psychiatric comorbidity are the most con-
current suicidal factors4. Some authors pointed to patients 
with schizophrenia as those at the highest risk of suicide in 
a hospital environment5 while others found a greater risk in 
aspects related to being male, having a history of multiple 
hospitalizations, and having a diagnosis of affective disorder, 
anxiety disorder, or mental disorder. personality6.

Suicide risk peaks in the periods immediately following 
hospital admission and discharge. The risk is particularly high 
in people with affective disorders and in people with short 
hospital treatment. These findings should lead to a system-
atic assessment of suicide risk among hospitalized patients 
before discharge7. There are aspects related to the experience 
of hospital admission by the patient that must be considered. 
A recent study examined whether perceived coercion during 
admission to psychiatric hospitalization increases the risk of 
suicide attempts after discharge. Of 905 participants, 67% 
supported the perception of coercion in psychiatric hospi-
talization and 168 (19%) made a suicide attempt after dis-
charge. Patients who perceived coercion during hospital ad-
mission were more likely to attempt suicide after discharge 
than those who did not. In contrast, there was no interaction 
between recent self-harm or suicidal ideation at admission 
and perceived coercion in post-discharge suicide attempts8.

However, the literature also includes the risk associated 
with hospital admission. Some authors have suggested that 
being an inpatient in a psychiatric unit is one of the stron-
gest statistical risk factors for suicide. It is generally assumed 
that this strong association is not causal but is the result of 
the combination of the selection of high-risk patients for 
admission and the imperfect protection against suicide of-
fered by psychiatric units. Logically, a third factor, which is 
causal, could play a role in the association. It has recently 
been suggested that adverse experiences in psychiatric units, 
such as trauma, stigma, and loss of social role, could precipi-
tate some suicides among hospitalized patients9.

Based on the above, suicide prevention guidelines that 
recommend that people identified as at risk of suicide receive 
treatment specifically aimed at reducing their suicide risk and 
services to ensure that they continue to participate in mental 
health care should also update preventive strategies in psychi-
atric hospitalization units but also medical-surgical10.
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